BID TABULATION

LAKE COUNTY ROAD DEPARTMENT SALT - 2024

LCE Project No. 2024-005

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety

24950 Country Club Blvd., Ste. 450
North Olmstead, Ohio 44070

PH: 800-600-7258
FX: 800-739-8705

Morton Salt, Inc.

444 W. Lake Street, STE. 3000
Chicago, IL 60606
PH: 855-655-4540

FX: 312-896-9208

Compass Materials Am., Inc.

9900 West 109th St. Ste. 100
Overland Park, KS 66210

PH: 800-323-1641 Option 2
FX: 913-3388-7945

Estimated | Measure
Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item Total
TREATED ROCK SALT
Delivered - Lost Nation Yard 1,800 TON $ 81.84|$ 147,312.00 | $ 103.43|$ 186,174.00 No Bid
Delivered - Painesville Yard 4,200 TON $ 81.84|% 343,728.00 | $ 103.43|$ 434,406.00 No Bid
Bid Total | $ 491,040.00 Bid Total $ 620,580.00| Bid Total No Bid
Price per ton if piled at Lost Nation
Yard TON $ 87.84 $ 123.43 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. Compass Materials Am., Inc. Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety
444 W. Lake Street, STE. 3000 9900 West 109th St. Ste. 100 24950 Country Club Blvd., Ste. 450
Chicago, IL 60606 Overland Park, KS 66210 North Olmstead, Ohio 44070
PH: 855-655-4540 PH: 800-323-1641 Option 2 PH: 800-600-7258
FX: 312-896-9208 FX: 913-3388-7945 FX: 800-739-8705
Estimated | Measure
Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item Total
UNTREATED BULK ROCK SALT
Delivered - Painesville Yard 15,000 TON $ 6143 1% 921,450.00 | $ 62.71 | $ 940,650.00 | $ 74.83 1 $1,122,450.00
Delivered - Lost Nation Yard 3,000 TON $ 6143 |$ 184,290.00 | $ 62.71 1% 188,130.00 | $ 7483 |$ 224,490.00
Bid Total | $ 1,105,740.00 Bid Total $1,128,780.00 | Bid Total | $ 1,346,940.00
Price per ton if piled at Lost Nation
Yard TON $ 71.43 $ 77.71 $ 80.83
Price per ton if piled at Painesville
Yard TON $ 71.43 $ 77.71 $ 80.83
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