

**BID TABULATION**  
**LAKE COUNTY ROAD DEPARTMENT SALT - 2023**  
**LCE Project No. 2023-011**

Description	Estimated Quantity	Measure Unit	Compass Materials Am., Inc.		Morton Salt, Inc.		Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety	
			Unit Price	Item Total	Unit Price	Item Total	Unit Price	Item Total
TREATED ROCK SALT								
Delivered - Lost Nation Yard	3,000	TON	No Bid		No Bid		\$ 81.31	\$ 243,930.00
Delivered - Painesville Yard	3,000	TON	No Bid		No Bid		\$ 81.31	\$ 243,930.00
			<b>Bid Total</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>Bid Total</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>Bid Total</b>	<b>\$ 487,860.00</b>

Price per ton if piled at Lost Nation Yard		TON	No Bid		No Bid		\$ 95.31	
--	--	-----	--------	--	--------	--	----------	--

Description	Estimated Quantity	Measure Unit	Compass Materials Am., Inc.		Morton Salt, Inc.		Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety	
			Unit Price	Item Total	Unit Price	Item Total	Unit Price	Item Total
UNTREATED BULK ROCK SALT								
Delivered - Painesville Yard	12,000	TON	\$ 64.68	\$ 776,160.00	\$ 68.29	\$ 819,480.00	\$ 73.71	\$ 884,520.00
Delivered - Lost Nation Yard	3,000	TON	\$ 64.68	\$ 194,040.00	\$ 68.29	\$ 204,870.00	\$ 73.71	\$ 221,130.00
			<b>Bid Total</b>	<b>\$ 970,200.00</b>	<b>Bid Total</b>	<b>\$ 1,024,350.00</b>	<b>Bid Total</b>	<b>\$ 1,105,650.00</b>

Price per ton if piled at Lost Nation Yard		TON	\$ 79.68		\$ 78.29		\$ 88.71	
--	--	-----	----------	--	----------	--	----------	--

Price per ton if piled at Painesville Yard		TON	\$ 79.68		\$ 78.29		\$ 88.71	
--	--	-----	----------	--	----------	--	----------	--