
BID TABULATION

LAKE COUNTY ROAD DEPARTMENT SALT - 2021

LCE Project No. 2021-004

Description

Estimated 

Quantity

Measure 

Unit  Unit Price   Item Total  Unit Price   Item Total  Unit Price   Item Total 

TREATED ROCK SALT

Delivered  - Lost Nation Yard 3,000 TON  $        84.29  $    252,870.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Delivered  - Painesville Yard 3,000 TON  $        84.29  $    252,870.00  No Bid   No Bid 

Bid Total  $    505,740.00 Bid Total  No Bid Bid Total  No Bid 

Price per ton if piled at Lost Nation 

Yard TON  $        94.29  No Bid  No Bid 

Description

Estimated 

Quantity

Measure 

Unit  Unit Price   Item Total  Unit Price   Item Total  Unit Price   Item Total 

UNTREATED BULK ROCK SALT

Delivered  - Painesville Yard 8,000 TON  $        68.42  $    547,360.00  $        50.34  $    402,720.00  $            67.27  $    538,160.00 

Delivered  - Madison Yard 1,000 TON  $        68.42  $      68,420.00  $        50.34  $      50,340.00  $            67.27  $      67,270.00 

Delivered - Lost Nation Yard 4,000 TON  $        68.42  $    273,680.00  $        50.34  $    201,360.00  $            67.27  $    269,080.00 

Bid Total  $    889,460.00 Bid Total  $    654,420.00 Bid Total  $    874,510.00 

Price per ton if piled at Lost Nation 

Yard TON  $        78.42  $        56.84  $            74.27 

 Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety 

 24950 Country Club Blvd., Ste. 450 

 No bid placed for Treated Rock Salt 

 Compass Minerals America, Inc. 

 9900 West 109th Street, Ste. 100 

 Overland Park, KS 66210 

 PH: 800-323-1641, Option 2 

 No bid placed for Treated Rock Salt 

 FX: 913-338-7945 

 North Olmstead, Ohio 44070 

 Morton Salt, Inc. 

 444 W. Lake Street, Ste. 3000 
 Chicago, IL 60606 

 PH: 855-655-4540 

 FX: 312-896-9208 

 PH: 800-600-7258 

 FX: 800-739-8705 
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