
BID TABULATION

Roadway Materials - 2022

LCE Project No. 2022-002

Ref. No. Description

Estimated 

Quantity

Measure 

Unit  Unit Price   Item Total  Unit Price   Item Total  Unit Price   Item Total  Unit Price   Item Total  Unit Price   Item Total 

A. LIMESTONE   

1 #12 - Delivered Painesville Yard 600 TON  $            27.65  $     16,590.00  $            27.85  $     16,710.00  $                   -    $                  -    $                -   

2 #57 or #67 - Delivered Painesville Yard 1,500 TON  $            27.15  $     40,725.00  $            26.95  $     40,425.00  $                   -    $                  -    $                -   

3

#304, #411 or #617 - Delivered Painesville 

Yard 1,500 TON  $            20.50  $     30,750.00  $            21.70  $     32,550.00  $                   -    $                  -    $                -   

4 #8 - Delivered Painesville Yard 500 TON  $            28.80  $     14,400.00  $            26.75  $     13,375.00  $                   -    $                  -    $                -   

Bid Total  $   102,465.00 Bid Total  $   103,060.00 Bid Total  No Bid Bid Total  No Bid Bid Total  No Bid 

                          

B. PLANT MIX PAVEMENTS

1

441, Asphalt Concrete, Intermediate 

Course, Type 2 1,500 TON  $                   -    $                   -    $            60.50  $     90,750.00  $          75.00  $   112,500.00  $           75.00  $112,500.00 

2

441, Asphalt Concrete, Surface Course, 

Type 1 1,000 TON  $                   -    $                   -    $            69.50  $     69,500.00  $          85.00  $     85,000.00  $           85.00  $  85,000.00 

Bid Total  No Bid Bid Total  No Bid Bid Total  $   160,250.00 Bid Total  $   197,500.00 Bid Total  $197,500.00 

Cuyahoga Asphalt Materials, 

LLC

PO Box 107

Fredericktown, OH 43019

Kokosing Materials, Inc.

PO Box 334

Fredericktown, OH 43019
Grand River, Ohio 44045

PHONE: (740) 848-4918

FAX:  (740) 957-9253

PHONE: (740) 848-4918

FAX: (740) 957-9253

PHONE: (440) 357-5562

FAX: (440) 357-8560

The Arms Trucking Company

14818 Mayfield Rd.,                

PO Box 369

E. Claridon, OH  44033

PHONE: (800) 362-1343

FAX:  (440) 0635-0988

Osborne Concrete & Stone 

Co.

1 Williams St.,                                      

PO Box 249

Grand River Asphalt Co.

1 Williams St.,                                      

PO Box 249

Grand River, Ohio 44045

PHONE: (440) 357-5562

FAX: (440) 357-8560
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