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FEBRUARY 28, 2024

THE FOLLOWING BID PROPOSALS FOR THE RED CREEK SANITARY SEWER IMPROVEMENTS-CONTRACT A AND
CONTRACT B - PROJECT NO 280-S FOR THE LAKE COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF UTILITIES WERE RECEIVED BY THE
LAKE COUNTY COMMISSIONERS ON WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 28, 2024 AT 11:00 AM:

PROPOSAL

Chivers Construction Co, Inc.
6700 Tow Road

Fairview, PA 16415

BID BOND YES

ADDENDUM #1 ACK: YES

ADDENDUM #2 ACK: YES

CONTRACT A BID AMOUNT: $4,227,336.50
CONTRACT A-ALTERNATE BID AMT: $1,563,800.00
CONTRACT B BID AMOUNT: $2,354,305.00
CONTRACT B-ALTERNATE BID AMOUNT: $69,314.00
COMBINED BID AMOUNT: $6,478,183.50
COMBINED ALTERNATE BID AMOUNT: $1,563,800.00

PROPOSAL

Great Lakes Crushing

30831 Euclid Ave

Willowick, Ohio 44092

BID BOND(S) YES

ADDENDUM #1 ACK: YES

ADDENDUM #2 ACK: YES

CONTRACT A BID AMOUNT: $6,124,898.00
CONTRACT A-ALTERNATE BID AMT: $2,736,650.00
CONTRACT B BID AMOUNT: $2,323,000.00
CONTRACT B-ALTERNATE BID AMT: NONE
COMBINED BID AMOUNT: $8,449,898.00
COMBINED ALTERNATE BID AMOUNT: NONE

PROPOSAL

J Severino Construction, Inc.

937 West 52nd Street

Ashtabula, Ohio 44004

BID BOND(S) YES

ADDENDUM #1 ACK: YES

ADDENDUM #2 ACK: YES

CONTRACT A BID AMOUNT: $4,164,446.34
CONTRACT A-ALTERNATE BID AMT: $1,707,825.98
CONTRACT B BID AMOUNT: $1,758,917.48
CONTRACT B-ALTERNATE BID AMOUNT: $60,525.00
COMBINED BID AMOUNT: NOT LISTED

COMBINED ALTERNATE BID AMOUNT: NOT LISTED

PROPOSAL

J.S. Bova Excavating

235 State Street, P. O. Box 296

Struthers, Ohio 44471

BID BOND(S) YES

ADDENDUM #1 ACK: YES

ADDENDUM #2 ACK: YES

CONTRACT A BID AMOUNT: $6,298,588.50
CONTRACT A-ALTERNATE BID AMT: $2,681,917.00
CONTRACT B BID AMOUNT: NO BID

CONTRACT B-ALTERNATE BID AMOUNT: $ NO BID
COMBINED BID AMOUNT: NOT LISTED
COMBINED ALTERNATE BID AMOUNT: $ NOT LISTED

PROPOSAL

Rudzik Excavating

401 Lowellville Road

P.O Box 206

Struthers, Ohio 44471

BID BOND(S) YES

ADDENDUM #1 ACK: YES

ADDENDUM #2 ACK: YES

CONTRACT A BID AMOUNT: $4,923,582.00
CONTRACT A-ALTERNATE BID AMT: $5,359,108.00
CONTRACT B BID AMOUNT: $2,574,766.00
CONTRACT B-ALTERNATE BID AMOUNT: $62,345.80
COMBINED BID AMOUNT: $7,178,700.00
COMBINED ALTERNATE BID AMOUNT: $62,345.80

PROPOSAL

Triad Engineering & Contracting Co., Inc.
9715 Clinton Road

Brooklyn, Ohio 44144

BID BOND(S) YES

ADDENDUM #1 ACK: YES

ADDENDUM #2 ACK: YES

CONTRACT A BID AMOUNT: NO BID

CONTRACT A-ALTERNATE BID AMOUNT: NO BID
CONTRACT B BID AMOUNT: $2,255,000.00
COMBINED BID AMOUNT: $2,311,635.00
CONTRACT B-ALTERNATE BID AMOUNT: NOT LISTED
COMBINED ALTERNATE BID AMOUNT: NOT LISTED



