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THE FOLLOWING BID PROPOSALS FOR COLD WATER METERS FOR THE LAKE COUNTY UTILITIES DEPARTMENT
WERE RECEIVED BY THE BOARD OF LAKE COUNTY COMMISSIONERS ON WEDNESDAY, OCTOBER 4, 2023 AT
11:00 AM:

PROPOSAL
FERGUSON WATERWORKS
3845 GROVEPORT ROAD
COLUMBUS, OH 43207

ITEM NO. QUANTITY SIZE DESCRIPTION BID AMOUNT
1. 100 more or less 5/8" X 1/2" Multi-jet residential water $327.00

meter with AMI RF endpoint,
suitable for inside or pit type
settings. Reading in 100CF

2. 500 more or less 5/8" X 3/4" Multi-jet residential water $318.00
meter with AMI RF endpoint,
suitable for inside or pit type
settings. Reading in 100CF

3. 500 more or less 1" Multi-jet residential water meter $432.00
with AMI RF endpoint,
suitable for inside or pit type settings.
Reading in 100CF

4. 40 more or less 1 1/2" Multi-jet flanged, commercial $795.00
water meter with AMI RF endpoint,
suitable for inside or pit type settings.
Reading in 100CF.With flange kits.

5. 60 more or less 2" Multi-jet flanged, commercial $ 1,030.00
water meter with AMI RF endpoint,
suitable for inside or pit type settings.
Reading in 100CF.With flange kits.

6. 60 more or less 2" Stainless steel bodied ultrasonic $ 2,119.00
meter with floating flanges and AMI RF
endpoint.

7. 10 more or less 3" Stainless steel bodied ultrasonic $ 3,319.00
meter with floating flanges and AMI
RF endpoint.

8. 20 more or less 4" Stainless steel bodied ultrasonic $ 5,402.00
meter with floating flanges and AMI
RF endpoint.

9. 10 more or less 6" Stainless steel bodied ultrasonic $ 8,760.00
meter with floating flanges and AMI
RF endpoint.

10. 10 more or less 8" Stainless steel bodied ultrasonic $ 11,997.00
meter with floating flanges and AMI
RF endpoint.

11. 400 more or less RF Wall mounted endpoint $ 199.00

12. 400 more or less RF Pit mounted endpoint $ 199.00

13. 20 more or less Low profile antenna $ 76.00

BID BOND: YES



35

PROPOSAL
CORE AND MAIN, LP
EASTLAKE, OH 44095

ITEM NO. QUANTITY SIZE DESCRIPTION BID AMOUNT
1. 100 more or less 5/8" X 1/2" Multi-jet residential water $ 142.00

meter with AMI RF endpoint,
suitable for inside or pit type
settings. Reading in 100CF

2. 500 more or less 5/8" X 3/4" Multi-jet residential water $ 142.00
meter with AMI RF endpoint,
suitable for inside or pit type
settings. Reading in 100CF

3. 500 more or less 1" Multi-jet residential water meter $ 235.00
with AMI RF endpoint,
suitable for inside or pit type settings.
Reading in 100CF

4. 40 more or less 1 1/2" Multi-jet flanged, commercial NO BID
water meter with AMI RF endpoint,
suitable for inside or pit type settings.
Reading in 100CF.With flange kits.

5. 60 more or less 2" Multi-jet flanged, commercial NO BID
water meter with AMI RF endpoint,
suitable for inside or pit type settings.
Reading in 100CF.With flange kits.

6. 60 more or less 2" Stainless steel bodied ultrasonic NO BID
meter with floating flanges and AMI RF
endpoint.

7. 10 more or less 3" Stainless steel bodied ultrasonic NO BID
meter with floating flanges and AMI
RF endpoint.

8. 20 more or less 4" Stainless steel bodied ultrasonic NO BID
meter with floating flanges and AMI
RF endpoint.

9. 10 more or less 6" Stainless steel bodied ultrasonic NO BID
meter with floating flanges and AMI
RF endpoint.

10. 10 more or less 8" Stainless steel bodied ultrasonic NO BID
meter with floating flanges and AMI
RF endpoint.

11. 400 more or less RF Wall mounted endpoint $ 168.00

12. 400 more or less RF Pit mounted endpoint $ 168.00

13. 20 more or less Low profile antenna NO BID

BID BOND: YES
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PROPOSAL
EJ PRESCOTT
32 PRESCOTT STREET
GARDINER, ME 04345

ITEM NO. QUANTITY SIZE DESCRIPTION BID AMOUNT
1. 100 more or less 5/8" X 1/2" Multi-jet residential water $302.00

meter with AMI RF endpoint,
suitable for inside or pit type
settings. Reading in 100CF

2. 500 more or less 5/8" X 3/4" Multi-jet residential water $302.00
meter with AMI RF endpoint,
suitable for inside or pit type
settings. Reading in 100CF

3. 500 more or less 1" Multi-jet residential water meter $423.00
with AMI RF endpoint,
suitable for inside or pit type settings.
Reading in 100CF

4. 40 more or less 1 1/2" Multi-jet flanged, commercial $ 1,070.00
water meter with AMI RF endpoint,
suitable for inside or pit type settings.
Reading in 100CF.With flange kits.

5. 60 more or less 2" Multi-jet flanged, commercial $ 1,375.00
water meter with AMI RF endpoint,
suitable for inside or pit type settings.
Reading in 100CF.With flange kits.

6. 60 more or less 2" Stainless steel bodied ultrasonic $ 1,375.00
meter with floating flanges and AMI RF
endpoint.

7. 10 more or less 3" Stainless steel bodied ultrasonic $ 2,343.00
meter with floating flanges and AMI
RF endpoint.

8. 20 more or less 4" Stainless steel bodied ultrasonic $ 3,361.00
meter with floating flanges and AMI
RF endpoint.

9. 10 more or less 6" Stainless steel bodied ultrasonic $ 3,373.00
meter with floating flanges and AMI
RF endpoint.

10. 10 more or less 8" Stainless steel bodied ultrasonic $ 5,472.00
meter with floating flanges and AMI
RF endpoint.

11. 400 more or less RF Wall mounted endpoint $ 183.00

12. 400 more or less RF Pit mounted endpoint $ 183.00

13. 20 more or less Low profile antenna NO BID

BID BOND: YES


