80 MARCH 15, 2023

THE FOLLOWING BID PROPOSALS FOR CHEMICALS FOR THE LAKE COUNTY UTILITIES DEPARTMENT WERE
RECEIVED BY THE BOARD OF LAKE COUNTY COMMISSIONERS ON WEDNESDAY, MARCH 15,2023 AT 11:00 AM:

PROPOSAL

SHANNON CHEMICAL

602 JEFFERS CIR 116

EXTON, PA 19341-2539

BID AMOUNT: SEE FOLLOWING PAGES

PROPOSAL

UNIVAR USA, INC

328 BUNOLA RIVER ROAD

BUNOLA, PA 15020

BID AMOUNT: SEE FOLLOWING PAGES

PROPOSAL

USALCO

1120 MIDDLE RIVER ROAD

BALTIMORE, MD 21220

BID AMOUNT: SEE FOLLOWING PAGES

PROPOSAL

BONDED CHEMICALS INC

2645 CHARTER ST

COLUMBUS, OH 43228-4605

BID AMOUNT: SEE FOLLOWING PAGES

PROPOSAL

KEMIRA WATER SOLUTIONS, INC

3211 CLINTON PKY. CT. STE. #1
LAWRENCE, KANSAS 66047

BID AMOUNT: SEE FOLLOWING PAGES

PROPOSAL

CHEMTRADE CHEMICALS

90 EAST HALSEY ROAD

PARSIPPANY, NJ 07054

BID AMOUNT: SEE FOLLOWING PAGES

PROPOSAL

JCI JONES CHEMICALS INC

1765 RINGLING BLVD

SARASOTA, FL 34236

BID AMOUNT:SEE FOLLOWING PAGES

PROPOSAL

SAL CHEMICAL

3036 BIRCH DRIVE

WEIRTON, WV 26062

BID AMOUNT: SEE FOLLOWING PAGES

PROPOSAL

PENCCO, INC

PO BOX 600

SAN FELIPE, TX 77473

BID AMOUNT: NO BID SUBMITTED

PROPOSAL

CHEMRITE, INC.

5202 BELLE WOOD CORT SUITE 104
BUFORD, GA 30518

BID AMOUNT: SEE FOLLOWING PAGES

PROPOSAL

ALEXANDER CHEMICAL CORP.

7593 S. FIRST ROAD

KINGSBURY, IN 46345

BID AMOUNT: SEE FOLLOWING PAGES

PROPOSAL

PVS TECHNOLOGIES, INC.

10900 HARPER AVENUE

DETROIT, MI 48213

BID AMOUNT: SEE FOLLOWING PAGES

PROPOSAL
CARUS CHEMICAL

315 5™ STREET

PERU, IL 61354

BID AMOUNT: SEE FOLLOWING PAGES

PROPOSAL

CALGON CARBON CORP.

3000 GSK DRIVE

MOON TWP., PA 15108

BID AMOUNT: SEE FOLLOWING PAGES

PROPOSAL

JCI JONES CHEMICAL INC.

1765 RINGLING BLVD.

SARASOTA, FL 34236

BID AMOUNT: SEE FOLLOWING PAGES



Chemical

Activated Carbon

Alum Polymer

Chlorine

Hydrofluosilcic Acid

MARCH 15, 2023

Company

Bonded Chemical
Chemrite

Calgon Carbon

USALCO

Chemtrade Chemicals

JCl Jones Chemicals

SAL Chemical

Alexander Chemical

Univar USA Inc.

Potassium Permanganate Bonded Chemical

Zinc Orthophosphate

Sodium Hypochlorite

Sodium Bisulfite

Ferrous Chloride

BB = Bid Bond

Chemrite

SAL Chemical

Shannon Chemical

Sal Chemical

Chemrite

Carus

JCl Jones Chemicals

Alexander Chemicals

Bonded Chemical

Alexander Chemicals

JCl Jones Chemicals
PVS Chemicals

Kemira Water Solutions

PVS Chemicals

Facility

Aquarius

Bacon Rd.

Aquarius

Bacon Rd.

Aquarius

Bacon Rd.

Aquarius

Bacon Rd.

Aquarius

Bacon Rd.

Bacon Rd.

Aquarius

Bacon Rd.

Aquarius

Bacon Rd.

Aquarius

Bacon Rd.

Aquarius

Bacon Rd.

Aquarius

Bacon Rd.

Aquarius

Bacon Rd.

Aquarius

Bacon Rd.

Aquarius

Bacon Rd.

Aquarius

Bacon Rd.

Aquarius

Bacon Rd.

GLKWRF
Aquarius
GLKWRF
Aquarius
GLKWRF
Aquarius

GLKWRF
GLKWRF
GLKWRF

GLKWRF
Madison
Glyco
GLKWRF
Madison
Glyco

Amount

60,000
14,000
60,000
14,000
60,000
14,000

83,000
32,000
83,000
32,000

13.5

122,000
45,000
122,000
45,000
122,000
45,000

7,500
4,000
7,500
4,000
7,500
4,000

60,000
25,000
60,000
25,000
60,000
25,000
60,000
25,000

46,000
68,000
46,000
68,000
46,000
68,000

24,000
24,000
24,000

240,000
50,000
55,000
240,000
50,000
55,000

Bond\ Unit
Check Price
BB NO BID
BB $1.07
BB $1.588
BB $1.68
BB $1.42
BB NO BID
BB $2.86
BB $2.86
BB $3.924
BB $3.924
BB $2,475.00
BB NO BID
BB $0.336
BB $0.359
BB NO BID
BB $0.25
BB $0.25
BB $4.43
BB $4.43
BB $4.75
BB $4.75
BB $3.70
BB $3.70
BB $1.07
BB $1.17
BB $1.10
BB $1.10
BB $1.35
BB $1.35
BB $1.14
BB $1.35
BB $2.2819
BB $2.2819
BB $2.73
BB $2.73
BB $2.50
BB $2.50
BB $4.24
BB $2.43
BB $2.90
BB $0.466
BB $0.466
BB $0.466
BB $1.38
BB $1.38
BB $1.38
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