May 10, 2017

THE FOLLOWING BID PROPOSALS FOR CHEMICALS FOR THE LAKE COUNTY UTILITIES DEPARTMENT WERE
RECEIVED BY THE BOARD OF LAKE COUNTY COMMISSIONERS ON WEDNESDAY, MAY 10, 2017 AT 11:00 AM:

PROPOSAL

THATCHER COMPANY

1905 FORTUNE ROAD

SALT LAKE CITY, UT 84104

BID AMOUNT: SEE FOLLOWING PAGES

PROPOSAL

MOSAIC

13830 CIRCA CROSSING DRIVE

LITHIA, FL 33547

BID AMOUNT: SEE FOLLOWING PAGES

PROPOSAL

SHANNON CHEMICAL

602 JEFFERS CIR 116

EXTON, PA 19341-2539

BID AMOUNT: SEE FOLLOWING PAGES

PROPOSAL

UNIVAR USA, INC

328 BUNOLA RIVER ROAD

BUNOLA, PA 15020

BID AMOUNT: SEE FOLLOWING PAGES

PROPOSAL

USALCO

1120 MIDDLE RIVER ROAD

BALTIMORE, MD 21220

BID AMOUNT: SEE FOLLOWING PAGES

PROPOSAL

BHS MARKETING

1717 E. FARGO

NAMPA, ID

BID AMOUNT: SEE FOLLOWING PAGES

PROPOSAL

BONDED CHEMICALS INC

2645 CHARTER ST

COLUMBUS, OH 43228-4605

BID AMOUNT: SEE FOLLOWING PAGES

PROPOSAL

KEMIRA WATER SOLUTIONS, INC

3211 CLINTON PKY. CT. STE. #1
LAWRENCE, KANSAS 66047

BID AMOUNT: SEE FOLLOWING PAGES

PROPOSAL

PVS TECHNICAL SOLUTIONS, INC
10900 HARPER AVENUE

DETROIT, MI 48213-3364

BID AMOUNT: SEE FOLLOWING PAGES

PROPOSAL

CHEMTRADE CHEMICALS

90 EAST HALSEY ROAD

PARSIPPANY, NJ 07054

BID AMOUNT: SEE FOLLOWING PAGES

PROPOSAL

JCI JONES CHEMICALS INC

1765 RINGLING BLVD

SARASOTA, FL 34236

BID AMOUNT:SEE FOLLOWING PAGES

PROPOSAL

SAL CHEMICAL

3036 BIRCH DRIVE

WEIRTON, WV 26062

BID AMOUNT: SEE FOLLOWING PAGES

PROPOSAL

PENCCO, INC

PO BOX 600

SAN FELIPE, TX 77473

BID AMOUNT: NO BID SUBMITTED

PROPOSAL

CALGON CARBON CORPORATION

3000 GSK DRIVE

MOON TOWNSHIP, PA 15108

BID AMOUNT: SEE FOLLOWING PAGES

PROPOSAL
CARUS CHEMCIAL

315 5™ STREET

PERU, IL 61354

BID AMOUNT: SEE FOLLOWING PAGES

PROPOSAL

GEO SPECIALTY CHEMICALS

9213 ARCH STREET PIKE

LITTLE ROCK, AR 72206

BID AMOUNT: NO BID SUBMITTED

PROPOSAL

STERLING WATER TECHNOLOGIES

3015 STATE ROAD

CROYDON, PA 19021

BID AMOUNT: SEE FOLLOWING PAGES

PROPOSAL

CHEMRITE INC

5202 BELLE WOOD CT SUITE 104
BUFORD, GA

BID AMOUNT: SEE FOLLOWING PAGES

PROPOSAL

OXBOW ACTIVATED CARBON

2535 JASON CT

OCEANSIDE, CA

BID AMOUNT: SEE FOLLOWING PAGES
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Chemical Company Facility Amount Bond\ Unit
Check Price
Activated Carbon Bonded Chemical Aquarius 30,000 BB $0.984
Bacon Rd. 12,000 BB $0.78
Sal Chemical Aquarius 30,000 BB $1.138
Bacon Rd. 12,000 BB $1.07
Calgon Carbon Corp. Aquarius 30,000 BB $1.08
Bacon Rd. 12,000 BB $1.08
Thatcher Co. Aquarius 30,000 BB NO BID
Bacon Rd. 12,000 BB $0.825
Oxbow Carbon Activated Aquarius 30,000 BB $0.79
Bacon Rd. 12,000 BB NO BID
Chemrite Aquarius 30,000 CK NO BID
Bacon Rd. 12,000 CK $0.82
Alum Polymer USALCO Aquarius 83,000 BB $1.744
Bacon Rd. 32,000 BB $1.744
Chemtrade Chemicals Aquarius 83,000 BB $2.15
Bacon Rd. 32,000 BB $2.15
Chlorine JCl Jones Chemicals Bacon Rd. 13.5 BB $625.00
Hydrofluosilcic Acid BHS Marketing Aquarius 122,000 BB $0.1740
Bacon Rd. 45,000 BB $0.1740
Mosaic Aquarius 122,000 BB $0.082
Bacon Rd. 45,000 BB $0.0777
Univar USA Inc. Aquarius 122,000 BB $0.169
Bacon Rd. 45,000 BB $0.169
Potassium Permanganate Bonded Chemical Aquarius 7,500 BB $3.125
Bacon Rd. 4,000 BB $3.125
Shannon Chemical Aquarius 7,500 BB $2.37
Bacon Rd. 4,000 BB $2.37
Univar USA Aquarius 7,500 BB $3.28
Bacon Rd. 4,000 BB $3.28
Zinc Orthophosphate Shannon Chemical Aquarius 50,000 CK $0.407
Bacon Rd. 18,000 CK $0.482
Sal Chemical Aquarius 50,000 BB $0.38
Bacon Rd. 18,000 BB $0.839
Chemrite Aquarius 50,000 CK $0.400
Bacon Rd. 18,000 CK $0.475
Sterling Water Trtmt Aquarius 50,000 BB $0.4997
Bacon Rd. 18,000 BB $0.6587
Carus Corp. Aquarius 50,000 BB $0.356
Bacon Rd. 18,000 BB $0.474
Sodium Hypochlorite JCl Jones Chemicals GLKWRF 46,000 BB $0.59
Aquarius 68,000 BB $0.59
Sal Chemical GLKWRF 46,000 BB $0.85
Aquarius 68,000 BB $0.85
Bonded Chemical GLKWRF 46,000 BB $0.555
Aquarius 68,000 BB $0.555
Sodium Bisulfite PVS Technology GLKWRF 24,000 BB $1.40
JCl Jones Chemicals GLKWRF 24,000 BB $1.25
Ferrous Chloride PVS Technology GLKWRF 240,000 BB $0.213
Madison 50,000 BB $0.213
Glyco 55,000 BB $0.213
Kemira Water Solutions GLKWRF 240,000 BB $0.209
Madison 50,000 BB $0.209

Glyco 55,000 BB $0.209



BB = Bid Bond CC =Certified/Cashiers Check

MAY 10, 2017
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