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THE FOLLOWING BID PROPOSALS FOR COLD WATER METERS FOR THE LAKE COUNTY UTILITIES DEPARTMENT
WERE RECEIVED BY THE BOARD OF LAKE COUNTY COMMISSIONERS ON WEDNESDAY, MARCH 8, 2017 AT

11:00 AM:
PROPOSAL
HD SUPPLY WATERWORKS
1567 EAST 367" STREET
EASTLAKE, OH 44095
ITEM NO. QUANTITY
1 40 more or less
2 400 more or less
3 24 more or less
4 40 more or less
5 400 more or less
6 24 more or less
7 24 more or less
8 24 more or less
9 1 more or less
10 1 more or less
11 50 more or less
12 1 more or less
13 1 more or less
14 1 more or less
15 1 more or less
16 1 more or less
17 1 more or less
18 200 more or less
19 200 more or less
20 200 more or less
TRADE-IN: 5/8" meters:
3/4" meters:
1" meters:

1%” meters:

BID BOND

SIZE DESCRIPTION
5/8"x1/2" Without touchbutton
5/8" x 3/4" Without touchbutton
1" Without touchbutton
5/8"x1/2" With touchbutton
5/8" x 3/4" With touchbutton

1" With touchbutton
1-1/2" With pit pad, 20' wire
2" With pit pad, 20" wire

Model 4090 Auto Gun

Model AR 5502

510RA MXUtouch coupler with atl. Freq.

520RA MXU (pitset)touch coupler with atl. freq.

510M MXU (non-pit) touch coupler
520 M MXU (pit-set) touch coupler
Model AR 5005 charging stand master
Model AR 5006 charging stand auxiliary
Model AR 4090 ext pit probe

Touchpad less wire

Slimline

Housing package lig kit

BID AMOUNT
$107.00

$107.00
$184.00
$126.00
$126.00
$203.00
$1,035.00
$1,193.00
$1,230.00
$10,775.00
$145.00
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
$865.00
NO BID
$255.00
$21.40
$26.54
$18.00
$1.25
$1.84

$3.16
$3.95
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THE FOLLOWING BID PROPOSALS FOR COLD WATER METERS FOR THE LAKE COUNTY UTILITIES DEPARTMENT
WERE RECEIVED BY THE BOARD OF LAKE COUNTY COMMISSIONERS ON WEDNESDAY, MARCH 8, 2017 AT
11:00 AM:

NEPTUNE EQUIPMENT, CO
11082 SOUTHLAND ROAD
CINCINNATI, OH 45240

ITEM NO. QUANTITY SIZE DESCRIPTION BID AMOUNT

1 40 more or less 5/8"x1/2" Without touchbutton $100.00

2 400 more or less 5/8" x 3/4" Without touchbutton $100.00

3 24 more or less 1" Without touchbutton $179.00

4 40 more or less 5/8"x1/2" With touchbutton $110.00

5 400 more or less 5/8" x 3/4" With touchbutton $110.00

6 24 more or less 1" With touchbutton $185.00

7 24 more or less 1-1/2" With pit pad, 20' wire $410.00

8 24 more or less 2" With pit pad, 20' wire $512.00

9 1 more or less Model 4090 Auto Gun NO BID

10 1 more or less Model AR 5502 NO BID

11 50 more or less 510RA MXUtouch coupler with atl. Freq. NO BID

12 1 more or less 520RA MXU (pitset)touch coupler with atl. freq. NO BID

13 1 more or less 510M MXU (non-pit) touch coupler NO BID

14 1 more or less 520 M MXU (pit-set) touch coupler NO BID

15 1 more or less Model AR 5005 charging stand master NO BID

16 1 more or less Model AR 5006 charging stand auxiliary NO BID

17 1 more or less Model AR 4090 ext pit probe NO BID

18 200 more or less Touchpad less wire NO BID

19 200 more or less Slimline NO BID

20 200 more or less Housing package lig kit NO BID

TRADE-IN: 5/8" meters: NO TRADE IN
3/4" meters: NO TRADE IN
1"  meters: NO TRADE IN
1%"” meters: NO TRADE IN

BID BOND
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THE FOLLOWING BID PROPOSALS FOR COLD WATER METERS FOR THE LAKE COUNTY UTILITIES DEPARTMENT
WERE RECEIVED BY THE BOARD OF LAKE COUNTY COMMISSIONERS ON WEDNESDAY, MARCH 8, 2017 AT

11:00 AM:
FERGUSON WATERWORKS
3750 VALLEY ROAD
CLEVELAND, OH 44109
ITEM NO. QUANTITY
1 40 more or less
2 400 more or less
3 24 more or less
4 40 more or less
5 400 more or less
6 24 more or less
7 24 more or less
8 24 more or less
9 1 more or less
10 1 more or less
11 50 more or less
12 1 more or less
13 1 more or less
14 1 more or less
15 1 more or less
16 1 more or less
17 1 more or less
18 200 more or less
19 200 more or less
20 200 more or less
TRADE-IN: 5/8" meters:
3/4" meters:
1" meters:

BID BOND

1%” meters:

SIZE DESCRIPTION
5/8"x1/2" Without touchbutton
5/8" x 3/4" Without touchbutton
1" Without touchbutton
5/8"x1/2" With touchbutton
5/8" x 3/4" With touchbutton

1" With touchbutton
1-1/2" With pit pad, 20' wire
2" With pit pad, 20" wire

Model 4090 Auto Gun

Model AR 5502

510RA MXUtouch coupler with atl. Freq.

520RA MXU (pitset)touch coupler with atl. freq.

510M MXU (non-pit) touch coupler
520 M MXU (pit-set) touch coupler
Model AR 5005 charging stand master
Model AR 5006 charging stand auxiliary
Model AR 4090 ext pit probe

Touchpad less wire

Slimline

Housing package lig kit

BID AMOUNT
$106.00

$106.00
$185.00
$116.00
$116.00
$186.00
$418.00
$555.00
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
$18.49
NO BID
$24.00
$2.00
$2.00

$2.00
$2.00
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THE FOLLOWING BID PROPOSALS FOR COLD WATER METERS FOR THE LAKE COUNTY UTILITIES DEPARTMENT
WERE RECEIVED BY THE BOARD OF LAKE COUNTY COMMISSIONERS ON WEDNESDAY, MARCH 8, 2017 AT

11:00 AM:

EVERETT J. PRESCOTT, INC
1580 FINDLAY ROAD
LIMA, OH 45801

ITEM NO. QUANTITY SIZE DESCRIPTION BID AMOUNT

1 40 more or less 5/8" x 1/2" Without touchbutton $91.21

2 400 more or less 5/8" x 3/4" Without touchbutton $89.00

3 24 more or less 1" Without touchbutton $158.79

4 40 more or less 5/8"x 1/2" With touchbutton $100.00

5 400 more or less 5/8" x 3/4" With touchbutton $100.00

6 24 more or less 1" With touchbutton $172.00

7 24 more or less 1-1/2" With pit pad, 20' wire NO BID

8 24 more or less 2" With pit pad, 20' wire NO BID

9 1 more or less Model 4090 Auto Gun NO BID

10 1 more or less Model AR 5502 NO BID

11 50 more or less 510RA MXUtouch coupler with atl. Freq. NO BID

12 1 more or less 520RA MXU (pitset)touch coupler with atl. freq. NO BID

13 1 more or less 510M MXU (non-pit) touch coupler NO BID

14 1 more or less 520 M MXU (pit-set) touch coupler NO BID

15 1 more or less Model AR 5005 charging stand master NO BID

16 1 more or less Model AR 5006 charging stand auxiliary NO BID

17 1 more or less Model AR 4090 ext pit probe NO BID

18 200 more or less Touchpad less wire $6.60

19 200 more or less Slimline NO BID

20 200 more or less Housing package lig kit NO BID

TRADE-IN: 5/8" meters: NO TRADE IN
3/4" meters: NO TRADE IN
1" meters: NO TRADE IN
1%"” meters: NO TRADE IN

BID BOND



