PROPOSAL

HD SUPPLY WATERWORKS
1521 E 367™ STREET
EASTLAKE, OH 44095

PIPE REPAIR CLAMPS:

1A
2A
3A
4A
5A
6A
7A
8A
9A
10A
11A
12A
13A
14A
15A
16A
17A
18A
19A
20A
21A
22A
23A
24A
25A
26A
27A
28A
29A
30A
31A
32A
33A
34A
35A
36A
1B
2B
3B
4B
5B

M.J. TEE BOLTS WITH NUT 304 OR 316:

4" X 8"
4"X8"x1"CC
4" X 16"
4"X16"X1"CC
6" X 8"

6" X8"x 1" CC
6" X 16"

6" X 16" x 1" CC
6" X 24-1/2"
8"Xx8"
8"X8"x1"CC
8" X 16"
8"X16"x1"CC
8" X 24"

12" X 8"

12" X 8"x 1" CC
12" X 16"

12" X 16" x 1" CC
12" X 24"

6" X 8"

6" X8"x 1" CC
6" X 16"

6" X 16" x 1" CC
6" X 24-1/2"

6" X 24" X1"CC
8"X8"
8"X8"x1"CC
8" X 16"
8"X16"x1"CC
8" X 24-1/2"

8" X24-1/2" X 1" CC
12" X 8"x 1" CC
12" X 16"

12" X 16" x 1" CC
12" X 24-1/2"
12" X 24-1/2" X 1" CC
4"

6"

g"

10"

12"

1C
2C
3C
4C

3/4" X 4"

3/4" X 4-1/2"

3/4" X 4" ANTI-ROTATING
3/4" X 4-1/2" ANTI-ROTATING

VALVE BOXES:

1D
2D
3D
4D
5D
6D
7D

ROUND VALVE BOX RISERS FOR C 5-1/4" VALVE BOXES:

C5-1/4"
#22
C5-1/4" 16"
C5-1/4" 26"
14"

18"

C5-1/4"

1E 1"
2E 2"
3E 3"
4E 4"
5E 6"
CURB BOXES:
1F CURB STOP BOX

BID AMOUNT
10 MORE OR LESS $77.64
10 MORE OR LESS $92.82
10 MORE OR LESS $153.06
10 MORE OR LESS $179.37
20 MORE OR LESS $90.27
20 MORE OR LESS $95.81
20 MORE OR LESS $174.96
20 MORE OR LESS $178.35
20 MORE OR LESS $217.14
20 MORE OR LESS $90.55
20 MORE OR LESS $96.01
20 MORE OR LESS $186.28
20 MORE OR LESS $191.93
20 MORE OR LESS $230.87
10 MORE OR LESS $125.97
10 MORE OR LESS $136.19
10 MORE OR LESS $234.74
10 MORE OR LESS $240.36
10 MORE OR LESS $301.49
10 MORE OR LESS $90.27
10 MORE OR LESS $95.81
10 MORE OR LESS $174.96
10 MORE OR LESS $178.35
10 MORE OR LESS $217.14
10 MORE OR LESS $223.47
10 MORE OR LESS $90.55
10 MORE OR LESS $96.01
10 MORE OR LESS $186.28
10 MORE OR LESS $191.93
10 MORE OR LESS $230.87
10 MORE OR LESS $236.36
10 MORE OR LESS $136.20
10 MORE OR LESS $234.74
10 MORE OR LESS $240.36
10 MORE OR LESS $301.49
10 MORE OR LESS $305.97
20 MORE OR LESS $74.07
50 MORE OR LESS $88.13
30 MORE OR LESS $110.55
10 MORE OR LESS $145.27
15 MORE OR LESS $176.60
BID AMOUNT
500 MORE OR LESS $4.60
500 MORE OR LESS $4.75
500 MORE OR LESS $7.50
500 MORE OR LESS $8.25
BID AMOUNT
30 MORE OR LESS $82.00
30 MORE OR LESS $59.00
30 MORE OR LESS $32.00
30 MORE OR LESS $45.00
30 MORE OR LESS $18.25
30 MORE OR LESS $21.45
30 MORE OR LESS $8.00
BID AMOUNT
30 MORE OR LESS $5.88
30 MORE OR LESS $8.24
30 MORE OR LESS $11.76
30 MORE OR LESS $12.94
30 MORE OR LESS $15.88
BID AMOUNT

30 MORE OR LESS

$28.00



2F
3F
4F
5F
6F
7F

16” EXTENSION

TOP SECTION CURB STOP BOX
TOP SECTION 101 CLEVELAND
CURB STOP BOX LID W/ BOLT
REPAIR LID 2-1/2" INNER
REPAIR LID 2-1/2" OUTER

100% BRONZE MUELLER SERVICE SADDLES:

1G
2G
3G
4G
5G

4"X1"cC
6" X 1" CC
8"X1"CC
10" X 1" CC
12" X 1" CC

BRASS CORPORATION STOPS WITH COUPLINGS:

1H
2H
3H
4H
5H
6H

3/4" FLARE OUTLET

1" FLARE OUTLET

1-1/2" FLARE OUTLET

2" FLARE OUTLET

1" M. X 3/4"FM. BRASS BUSHING
1" x 3/4" PIGGY BACK NUT

3 PART UNION FLARE X FLARE:

1l
21
3l
4|
51

3/4"

1
3/4"X1"
1-1/2"
"

CURB STOP WITH COUPLINGS FLARE TO FLARE:

1)
2]
3J
4]

3/4"
1|I
1-1/2"
2|I

SERVICE INSTALLATION PARTS:

1K
2K
3K
4K
5K
6K
7K
8K
9K
10K
11K
12K
13K
14K
15K
16K
17K
18K
19K

TooLs:
1L
2L
3L
4L

3/4" ANGLE YOKE VALVE

3/4" YOKE

3/4" ANGLE YOKE ELLS

1" ANGLE YOKE VALVE

1” YOKE

1” ANGLE YOKE ELLS

1-1/2” FLANGE X FLARE ANGLE VALVE
1-1/2” FLANGE X FLARE ANGLE ELL
3/4" EXPANSION CONNECTOR

1" EXPANSION CONNECTOR

5/8" X 3/4" X 2-1/2" METER CONNECTOR
5/8" X 3/4" X 2" METER CONNECTOR
1" X 2.625" METER CONNECTOR
METER BOX COVER & LID

METER BOX LID ONLY

18" X 24" EXPANSION RING

METER VAULT ELEVATOR RING 3"

18" X 30" PVC METER VAULT

24" X 30" PVC METER VAULT

3/4" MUELLER DRILL & TAP CC THREAD
1" MUELLER DRILL & TAP CC THREAD
1-1/2" DRILL & TAP

2" DRILL & TAP

HYDRANT COLLISION REPAIR KIT:

1M
2M
3M
aM
5M

MUELLER 5-1/4” A-423
KENNEDY 5-1/4” K10B
KENNEDY 5-1/4” K11
KENNEDY 5-1/4” K81
AM DARLING 5-1/4” B62

FIRE HYDRANTS & FITTINGS:

1IN
2N
3N

M.J. 5' NST MULLER 5-1/4"
M.J. 5" CST MULLER 5-1/4"
M.J. 6" NST MULLER 5-1/4"

50 MORE OR LESS

10 MORE OR LESS

50 MORE OR LESS

20 MORE OR LESS

30 MORE OR LESS $15.00
30 MORE OR LESS $19.00
30 MORE OR LESS $5.51
30 MORE OR LESS $6.50
30 MORE OR LESS $6.50
BID AMOUNT
20 MORE OR LESS $73.34
20 MORE OR LESS $86.36
20 MORE OR LESS $106.92
20 MORE OR LESS $132.46
20 MORE OR LESS $155.05
BID AMOUNT
50 MORE OR LESS $21.85
$33.39
10 MORE OR LESS $102.45
$178.97
75 MORE OR LESS $9.05
$14.36
BID AMOUNT
100 MORE OR LESS $12.11
50 MORE OR LESS $21.18
10 MORE OR LESS $17.92
10 MORE OR LESS $63.61
10 MORE OR LESS $103.78
BID AMOUNT
50 MORE OR LESS $48.21
25 MORE OR LESS $66.60
10 MORE OR LESS $161.76
10 MORE OR LESS $264.78
BID AMOUNT
50 MORE OR LESS $23.52
50 MORE OR LESS $8.27
50 MORE OR LESS $9.97
50 MORE OR LESS $36.20
50 MORE OR LESS $14.92
50 MORE OR LESS $17.43
10 MORE OR LESS $132.11
10 MORE OR LESS $81.69
100 MORE OR LESS $14.40
100 MORE OR LESS $24.19
200 MORE OR LESS $7.00
200 MORE OR LESS $7.00
100 MORE OR LESS $10.77
100 MORE OR LESS $53.01
50 MORE OR LESS $25.65
75 MORE OR LESS $67.74
50 MORE OR LESS $25.81
75 MORE OR LESS $38.72
75 MORE OR LESS $65.59
BID AMOUNT
12 MORE OR LESS $153.19
6 MORE OR LESS $203.53
6 MORE OR LESS $495.67
6 MORE OR LESS $695.90
BID AMOUNT
12 MORE OR LESS $142.16
12 MORE OR LESS $302.95
12 MORE OR LESS $302.95
12 MORE OR LESS $178.00
12 MORE OR LESS $275.00
BID AMOUNT
25 MORE OR LESS $1,875.68
10 MORE OR LESS $1,875.68
25 MORE OR LESS $1,958.82

$8.50



4N M.J. 6’ CST MULLER 5-1/4"
5N SPIN IN 6-1/2"NSTMULLER 5-1/4"
6N SPIN IN 6-1/2"CSTMULLER 5-1/4"
7N SPIN IN 6-1/2"NSTMULLER 4-1/2"
8N SPIN IN 6-1/2"CSTMULLER 4-1/2"
9N 6" X 4" X 15" PE/PE Cl REDUCER
10N 6" X 4" X 25" PE/PE Cl REDUCER
BID BOND

PROPOSAL

FERGUSON WATERWORKS

3750 VALLEY ROAD

10 MORE OR LESS
15 MORE OR LESS
15 MORE OR LESS
10 MORE OR LESS
10 MORE OR LESS

CLEVELAND, OHIO 44109

PIPE REPAIR CLAMPS:

1A
2A
3A
4A
5A
6A
7A
8A
9A
10A
11A
12A
13A
14A
15A
16A
17A
18A
19A
20A
21A
22A
23A
24A
25A
26A
27A
28A
29A
30A
31A
32A
33A
34A
35A
36A
1B
2B
3B
4B
5B

4" X 8"
4"X8"x1"CC
4" X 16"

4"X 16" X1"CC
6" X 8"

6" X8"x 1" CC
6" X 16"

6" X 16" x 1" CC
6" X 24-1/2"
8"X8"
8"X8"x1"CC
8" X 16"
8"X16"x1"CC
8" X 24"

12" X 8"

12" X8"x 1" CC
12" X 16"

12" X 16" x 1" CC
12" X 24"

6" X 8"

6" X8"x 1" CC
6" X 16"

6" X 16" x 1" CC
6" X 24-1/2"

6" X 24" X 1" CC
8" X 8"
8"X8"x1"CC
8" X 16"
8"X16"x1"CC
8" X 24-1/2"

8" X24-1/2" X 1" CC
12" X8"x 1" CC
12" X 16"

12" X 16" x 1" CC
12" X 24-1/2"
12" X 24-1/2" X 1" CC
4"

6"

g"

10"

12"

M.J. TEE BOLTS WITH NUT 304 OR 316:

1C
2C
3C
4C

3/4" X 4"

3/4" X 4-1/2"

3/4" X 4" ANTI-ROTATING
3/4" X 4-1/2" ANTI-ROTATING

VALVE BOXES:

1D
2D
3D
4D
5D
6D

C5-1/4"
#22
C5-1/4" 16"
C5-1/4" 26"
14"

18"

15 MORE OR LESS
15 MORE OR LESS

$1,958.82
$2,259.18
$2,259.18
$2,192.59
$2,192.59
$54.40
$185.60

BID AMOUNT

10 MORE OR LESS
10 MORE OR LESS
10 MORE OR LESS
10 MORE OR LESS
20 MORE OR LESS
20 MORE OR LESS
20 MORE OR LESS
20 MORE OR LESS
20 MORE OR LESS
20 MORE OR LESS
20 MORE OR LESS

20 MORE OR LESS

20 MORE OR LESS
20 MORE OR LESS
10 MORE OR LESS
10 MORE OR LESS
10 MORE OR LESS
10 MORE OR LESS
10 MORE OR LESS
10 MORE OR LESS
10 MORE OR LESS
10 MORE OR LESS
10 MORE OR LESS
10 MORE OR LESS
10 MORE OR LESS
10 MORE OR LESS
10 MORE OR LESS
10 MORE OR LESS
10 MORE OR LESS
10 MORE OR LESS
10 MORE OR LESS
10 MORE OR LESS
10 MORE OR LESS
10 MORE OR LESS
10 MORE OR LESS
10 MORE OR LESS
20 MORE OR LESS
50 MORE OR LESS
30 MORE OR LESS
10 MORE OR LESS
15 MORE OR LESS

$97.61

$104.91
$178.55
$194.50
$108.69
$117.86
$184.45
$232.25
$299.79
$113.15
$119.94

$225.92

$205.17
$244.51
$129.57
$133.79
$251.59
$256.98
$329.98
$95.71

$102.51
$184.45
$188.89
$299.79
$317.71
$113.15
$119.94
$221.47
$205.17
$244.50
$251.88
$133.79
$251.59
$256.99
$329.97
$374.24
$54.91

$86.38

$128.65
$155.52
$160.05

BID AMOUNT

500 MORE OR LESS
500 MORE OR LESS
500 MORE OR LESS
500 MORE OR LESS

$5.33
$5.67
$8.67
$9.01

BID AMOUNT

30 MORE OR LESS
30 MORE OR LESS
30 MORE OR LESS
30 MORE OR LESS
30 MORE OR LESS
30 MORE OR LESS

$91.10
$76.77
$29.47
$43.25
$20.00
$24.56



7D C5-1/4" 30 MORE OR LESS NO BID
ROUND VALVE BOX RISERS FOR C 5-1/4" VALVE BOXES: BID AMOUNT

1E 1" 30 MORE OR LESS $5.25
2E 2" 30 MORE OR LESS $11.15
3E 3" 30 MORE OR LESS $16.70
4E 4" 30 MORE OR LESS $22.30
5E 6" 30 MORE OR LESS $30.80
CURB BOXES: BID AMOUNT
1F CURB STOP BOX 30 MORE OR LESS $32.11
2F 16” EXTENSION 20 MORE OR LESS $12.44
3F TOP SECTION CURB STOP BOX 30 MORE OR LESS $17.00
4F TOP SECTION 101 CLEVELAND 30 MORE OR LESS $19.50
5F CURB STOP BOX LID W/ BOLT 30 MORE OR LESS NO BID
6F REPAIR LID 2-1/2" INNER 30 MORE OR LESS NO BID
7F REPAIR LID 2-1/2" OUTER 30 MORE OR LESS NO BID
100% BRONZE MUELLER SERVICE SADDLES: BID AMOUNT

1G 4"X 1" CC 20 MORE OR LESS $74.10
2G 6" X1" CC 20 MORE OR LESS $87.27
3G 8"X1"CC 20 MORE OR LESS $108.05
4G 10" X 1" CC 20 MORE OR LESS $133.87
5G 12" X 1" CC 20 MORE OR LESS $156.69
BRASS CORPORATION STOPS WITH COUPLINGS: BID AMOUNT
1H 3/4" FLARE OUTLET 50 MORE OR LESS $24.36
2H 1" FLARE OUTLET 50 MORE OR LESS $37.20

3H 1-1/2" FLARE OUTLET 10 MORE OR LESS $106.77
4H 2" FLARE OUTLET 10 MORE OR LESS $195.91

5H 1" M. X 3/4"FM. BRASS BUSHING 75 MORE OR LESS NO BID
6H 1" x 3/4" PIGGY BACK NUT 50 MORE OR LESS NO BID

3 PART UNION FLARE X FLARE: BID AMOUNT

1l 3/4" 100 MORE OR LESS $13.44
21 1" 50 MORE OR LESS $23.52
3l 3/4" X 1" 10 MORE OR LESS $19.92
41 1-1/2" 10 MORE OR LESS $71.17
51 2" 10 MORE OR LESS $116.13
CURB STOP WITH COUPLINGS FLARE TO FLARE: BID AMOUNT

1) 3/4" 50 MORE OR LESS $54.20
2] 1" 25 MORE OR LESS $74.89
3J 1-1/2" 10 MORE OR LESS $183.13
4) 2" 10 MORE OR LESS $299.85
SERVICE INSTALLATION PARTS: BID AMOUNT
1K 3/4" ANGLE YOKE VALVE 50 MORE OR LESS NO BID
2K 3/4" YOKE 50 MORE OR LESS NO BID
3K 3/4" ANGLE YOKE ELLS 50 MORE OR LESS NO BID
4K 1" ANGLE YOKE VALVE 50 MORE OR LESS NO BID
5K 1” YOKE 50 MORE OR LESS NO BID
6K 1” ANGLE YOKE ELLS 50 MORE OR LESS NO BID
7K 1-1/2” FLANGE X FLARE ANGLE VALVE 10 MORE OR LESS

8K 1-1/2” FLANGE X FLARE ANGLE ELL 10 MORE OR LESS NO BID
9K 3/4" EXPANSION CONNECTOR 100 MORE OR LESS NO BID
10K 1" EXPANSION CONNECTOR 100 MORE OR LESS NO BID
11K 5/8" X 3/4" X 2-1/2" METER CONNECTOR 200 MORE OR LESS NO BID
12K 5/8" X 3/4" X 2" METER CONNECTOR 200 MORE OR LESS NO BID
13K 1" X 2.625" METER CONNECTOR 100 MORE OR LESS NO BID
14K METER BOX COVER & LID 100 MORE OR LESS NO BID
15K METER BOX LID ONLY 50 MORE OR LESS NO BID
16K 18" X 24" EXPANSION RING 75 MORE OR LESS NO BID
17K METER VAULT ELEVATOR RING 3" 50 MORE OR LESS NO BID
18K 18" X 30" PVC METER VAULT 75 MORE OR LESS $37.40
19K 24" X 30" PVC METER VAULT 75 MORE OR LESS $63.35
TOOLS: BID AMOUNT

1L 3/4" MUELLER DRILL & TAP CC THREAD 12 MORE OR LESS $151.57
2L 1" MUELLER DRILL & TAP CC THREAD 6 MORE OR LESS $201.36
3L 1-1/2" DRILL & TAP 6 MORE OR LESS $490.39
4L 2" DRILL & TAP 6 MORE OR LESS $688.50

NO BID



HYDRANT COLLISION REPAIR KIT:

BID AMOUNT

1M MUELLER 5-1/4” A-423 12 MORE OR LESS $140.45
2M KENNEDY 5-1/4” K10B 12 MORE OR LESS NO BID
3M KENNEDY 5-1/4” K11 12 MORE OR LESS NO BID
aM KENNEDY 5-1/4” K81 12 MORE OR LESS NO BID
5M AM DARLING 5-1/4” B62 12 MORE OR LESS $250.00
FIRE HYDRANTS & FITTINGS: BID AMOUNT

1N M.J. 5" NST MULLER 5-1/4" 25 MORE OR LESS $1,874.00
2N M.J. 5" CST MULLER 5-1/4" 10 MORE OR LESS $1,874.00
3N M.J. 6 NST MULLER 5-1/4" 25 MORE OR LESS $1,958.00
4N M.J. 6’ CST MULLER 5-1/4" 10 MORE OR LESS $1,958.00
5N SPIN IN 6-1/2"NSTMULLER 5-1/4" 15 MORE OR LESS $2,258.00
6N SPIN IN 6-1/2"CSTMULLER 5-1/4" 15 MORE OR LESS $2,258.00
7N SPIN IN 6-1/2"NSTMULLER 4-1/2" 10 MORE OR LESS $2,192.00
8N SPIN IN 6-1/2"CSTMULLER 4-1/2" 10 MORE OR LESS $2,192.00
9N 6" X 4" X 15" PE/PE Cl REDUCER 15 MORE OR LESS $53.25
10N 6" X 4" X 25" PE/PE Cl REDUCER 15 MORE OR LESS $182.15
BID BOND

PROPOSAL

LAKE ERIE WINNELSON

4547 HINCKLEY PARKWAY

CLEVELAND, OHIO 44109

PIPE REPAIR CLAMPS: BID AMOUNT

1A 4" X 8" 10 MORE OR LESS $84.39
2A 4"X8"x1"CC 10 MORE OR LESS $100.89
3A 4" X 16" 10 MORE OR LESS $166.39
4A 4"X 16" X1"CC 10 MORE OR LESS $194.99
5A 6" X 8" 20 MORE OR LESS $98.09
6A 6" X8"x 1" CC 20 MORE OR LESS $104.00
7A 6" X 16" 20 MORE OR LESS $190.19
8A 6" X 16" x 1" CC 20 MORE OR LESS $193.89
9A 6" X 24-1/2" 20 MORE OR LESS $234.00
10A 8"Xx8" 20 MORE OR LESS $97.99
11A 8"X8"x1"CC 20 MORE OR LESS $104.34
12A 8" X 16" 20 MORE OR LESS $204.35

13A 8"X16"x1" CC 20 MORE OR LESS $208.59
14A 8" X 24" 20 MORE OR LESS $251.00
15A 12" X 8" 10 MORE OR LESS $136.00
16A 12" X 8"x 1" CC 10 MORE OR LESS $147.99
17A 12" X 16" 10 MORE OR LESS $255.00
18A 12" X 16" x 1" CC 10 MORE OR LESS $261.00
19A 12" X 24" 10 MORE OR LESS $327.74
20A 6" X 8" 10 MORE OR LESS $98.00
21A 6" X8"x 1" CC 10 MORE OR LESS $104.00
22A 6" X 16" 10 MORE OR LESS $190.00
23A 6" X 16" x 1" CC 10 MORE OR LESS $193.00
24A 6" X 24-1/2" 10 MORE OR LESS $236.00
25A 6" X 24" X1" CC 10 MORE OR LESS $243.00
26A 8" X8" 10 MORE OR LESS $98.00
27A 8"X8"x1"CC 10 MORE OR LESS $104.00
28A 8" X 16" 10 MORE OR LESS $202.15
29A 8"X16"x1"CC 10 MORE OR LESS $208.45
30A 8" X 24-1/2" 10 MORE OR LESS $250.00
31A 8" X24-1/2" X 1" CC 10 MORE OR LESS $256.95
32A 12" X8"x 1" CC 10 MORE OR LESS $147.98
33A 12" X 16" 10 MORE OR LESS $255.00
34A 12" X 16" x 1" CC 10 MORE OR LESS $261.00
35A 12" X 24-1/2" 10 MORE OR LESS $327.74
36A 12" X 24-1/2" X 1" CC 10 MORE OR LESS $332.59
1B 4" 20 MORE OR LESS $78.95
2B 6" 50 MORE OR LESS $93.99
3B 8" 30 MORE OR LESS $117.99
4B 10" 10 MORE OR LESS $152.00
5B 12" 15 MORE OR LESS $189.00

27



28

M.J. TEE BOLTS WITH NUT 304 OR 316: BID AMOUNT
1C 3/4" X 4" 500 MORE OR LESS $4.35
2C 3/4" X 4-1/2" 500 MORE OR LESS $4.59
3C 3/4" X 4" ANTI-ROTATING 500 MORE OR LESS $7.20
4C 3/4" X 4-1/2" ANTI-ROTATING 500 MORE OR LESS $7.25
VALVE BOXES: BID AMOUNT
1D C5-1/4" 30 MORE OR LESS $74.95
2D #22 30 MORE OR LESS $60.00
3D C5-1/4" 16" 30 MORE OR LESS $28.00
4D C5-1/4" 26" 30 MORE OR LESS $43.00
5D 14" 30 MORE OR LESS $17.95
6D 18" 30 MORE OR LESS $21.20
7D C5-1/4" 30 MORE OR LESS NO BID
ROUND VALVE BOX RISERS FOR C 5-1/4" VALVE BOXES: BID AMOUNT
1E 1" 30 MORE OR LESS $4.75
2E 2" 30 MORE OR LESS $7.25
3E 3" 30 MORE OR LESS $10.50
4E 4" 30 MORE OR LESS $12.95
5E 6" 30 MORE OR LESS $17.95
CURB BOXES: BID AMOUNT
1F CURB STOP BOX 30 MORE OR LESS $24.70
2F 16” EXTENSION 20 MORE OR LESS $10.50
3F TOP SECTION CURB STOP BOX 30 MORE OR LESS $16.50
4F TOP SECTION 101 CLEVELAND 30 MORE OR LESS $16.50
5F CURB STOP BOX LID W/ BOLT 30 MORE OR LESS $3.95
6F REPAIR LID 2-1/2" INNER 30 MORE OR LESS $6.05
7F REPAIR LID 2-1/2" OUTER 30 MORE OR LESS $6.05
100% BRONZE MUELLER SERVICE SADDLES: BID AMOUNT

1G 4"X1"cC 20 MORE OR LESS NO BID
2G 6" X 1" CC 20 MORE OR LESS NO BID
3G 8"X1"CC 20 MORE OR LESS NO BID
4G 10" X 1" CC 20 MORE OR LESS NO BID
5G 12" X 1" CC 20 MORE OR LESS NO BID
BRASS CORPORATION STOPS WITH COUPLINGS: BID AMOUNT
1H 3/4" FLARE OUTLET 50 MORE OR LESS $21.35
2H 1" FLARE OUTLET 50 MORE OR LESS $32.63

3H 1-1/2" FLARE OUTLET 10 MORE OR LESS $99.17
4H 2" FLARE OUTLET 10 MORE OR LESS $173.23

5H 1" M. X 3/4"FM. BRASS BUSHING 75 MORE OR LESS $9.79
6H 1" x 3/4" PIGGY BACK NUT 50 MORE OR LESS $14.25

3 PART UNION FLARE X FLARE: BID AMOUNT

1l 3/4" 100 MORE OR LESS $22.00
21 1" 50 MORE OR LESS $21.15
3l 3/4" X 1" 10 MORE OR LESS $17.85
41 1-1/2" 10 MORE OR LESS $64.25
51 2" 10 MORE OR LESS $103.50
CURB STOP WITH COUPLINGS FLARE TO FLARE: BID AMOUNT

1 3/4" 50 MORE OR LESS $47.11
2] 1" 25 MORE OR LESS $65.04
3J 1-1/2" 10 MORE OR LESS $158.05
4) 2" 10 MORE OR LESS $258.72
SERVICE INSTALLATION PARTS: BID AMOUNT
1K 3/4" ANGLE YOKE VALVE 50 MORE OR LESS $23.49
2K 3/4" YOKE 50 MORE OR LESS $8.08
3K 3/4" ANGLE YOKE ELLS 50 MORE OR LESS $9.95
4K 1" ANGLE YOKE VALVE 50 MORE OR LESS $36.18
5K 1” YOKE 50 MORE OR LESS $14.58
6K 1” ANGLE YOKE ELLS 50 MORE OR LESS $17.41
7K 1-1/2” FLANGE X FLARE ANGLE VALVE 10 MORE OR LESS $134.90
8K 1-1/2” FLANGE X FLARE ANGLE ELL 10 MORE OR LESS $133.90



9K

10K
11K
12K
13K
14K
15K
16K
17K
18K
19K

TOOLS:
1L
2L
3L
4L

3/4" EXPANSION CONNECTOR

1" EXPANSION CONNECTOR

5/8" X 3/4" X 2-1/2" METER CONNECTOR
5/8" X 3/4" X 2" METER CONNECTOR
1" X 2.625" METER CONNECTOR
METER BOX COVER & LID

METER BOX LID ONLY

18" X 24" EXPANSION RING

METER VAULT ELEVATOR RING 3"
18" X 30" PVC METER VAULT

24" X 30" PVC METER VAULT

3/4" MUELLER DRILL & TAP CC THREAD
1" MUELLER DRILL & TAP CC THREAD
1-1/2" DRILL & TAP

2" DRILL & TAP

HYDRANT COLLISION REPAIR KIT:

1M
2M
3M
aM
5M

MUELLER 5-1/4” A-423
KENNEDY 5-1/4” K10B
KENNEDY 5-1/4” K11
KENNEDY 5-1/4” K81
AM DARLING 5-1/4” B62

FIRE HYDRANTS & FITTINGS:

1IN
2N
3N
4N
5N
6N
7N
8N
9N
10N

M.J. 5' NST MULLER 5-1/4"
M.J. 5" CST MULLER 5-1/4"
M.J. 6" NST MULLER 5-1/4"
M.J. 6" CST MULLER 5-1/4"

SPIN IN 6-1/2"NSTMULLER 5-1/4"
SPIN IN 6-1/2"CSTMULLER 5-1/4"
SPIN IN 6-1/2"NSTMULLER 4-1/2"
SPIN IN 6-1/2"CSTMULLER 4-1/2"
6" X 4" X 15" PE/PE Cl REDUCER
6" X 4" X 25" PE/PE Cl REDUCER

BID BOND

100 MORE OR LESS $14.39
100 MORE OR LESS $24.63
200 MORE OR LESS $6.98
200 MORE OR LESS $6.98
100 MORE OR LESS $10.76
100 MORE OR LESS $50.01
50 MORE OR LESS $24.50
75 MORE OR LESS $65.95
50 MORE OR LESS NO BID
75 MORE OR LESS $43.20
75 MORE OR LESS $57.95
BID AMOUNT
12 MORE OR LESS NO BID
6 MORE OR LESS NO BID
6 MORE OR LESS NO BID
6 MORE OR LESS NO BID
BID AMOUNT
12 MORE OR LESS NO BID
12 MORE OR LESS NO BID
12 MORE OR LESS NO BID
12 MORE OR LESS NO BID
12 MORE OR LESS NO BID
BID AMOUNT
25 MORE OR LESS NO BID
10 MORE OR LESS NO BID
25 MORE OR LESS NO BID
10 MORE OR LESS NO BID
15 MORE OR LESS NO BID
15 MORE OR LESS NO BID
10 MORE OR LESS NO BID
10 MORE OR LESS NO BID
15 MORE OR LESS NO BID
15 MORE OR LESS NO BID
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