BID TABULATION

Roadway Materials 201

6

Lake County Engineer's Road Department

Project No. 16-003-02

Stoneco Inc., Osborne Concrete & Stone | The Arms Trucking Company| Ontario Stone Corp. Shelly Materials, Inc. Kokosing Materials
dba Allied Corporation 1 Williams St., PO Box 249 | 14818 Mayfield Rd., PO Box 369 1246 River Rd. 8920 Canyon Falls, Suite 120 P.O.Box 334
8920 Canyon Falls Blvd.,
Suite 120 Grand River, Ohio 44045 E. Claridon, Ohio 44033 Cleveland, Ohio 44113 Twinsburg, Ohio 44087 |Fredericktown, OH 43019
Twinsburg, Ohio 44087
PHONE: 330.425.7861 PHONE: 440.357.5562 PHONE: 440.635.0990 PHONE: 216.631.3645 PHONE: 330.425.7861 PHONE: 740.694.9585
FAX: 330.425.3270 FAX: 440.357.8560 FAX: 440.635.0988 FAX: 216.631.1425 FAX: 330.425.3270 FAX: 740.694.1100
Estimated | Measure
Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item Total Unit Price  Item Total | Unit Price Item Total Unit Price  Item Total
LIMESTONE
#12 - Delivered Painesville Yard 250 TON No Bid $ 20.65| $ 5,162.50| $ 21.45| $ 5,36250]$ 25.00($ 6,250.00]$ 25.00|$ 6,250.00 No Bid
#57 or #67 - Delivered Painesville Yard 750 TON No Bid $ 20.65| $ 15,487.50| $ 21.35| $ 16,01250]$ 24.75[$18,56250]$ 25.00 | $ 18,750.00 No Bid
#304, #411 or #617 - Delivered Madison
Yard 800 TON No Bid $ 1730 [ $ 13,840.00| $ 19.05| $ 152400001 $ 20.25|$16,200.00]$ 20.35]|$% 16,280.00 No Bid
#304, #411 or #617 - Delivered
Painesville Yard 1,200 TON No Bid $ 16.15( $ 19,380.00| $ 16.95| $ 20,340.00] $ 20.25 | $24,300.00 | $ 20.35|$% 24,420.00 No Bid
#8 - Delivered Painesville Yard 500 TON No Bid $ 2195| $ 10,975.00| $ 2275 $ 11,375.00]$ 24.75[$12,375.00]$ 2575 | $ 12,875.00 No Bid
Type D Limestone - Delivered Painesville
Yard 200 TON No Bid $ 38.80| $ 7,760.00| $ 36.50 | $ 7,300.000 $ 40.00 | $ 8,000.00|$ 41.15($ 8,230.00 No Bid
Bid Total No Bid Bid Total | $ 72,605.00 Bid Total | $ 75,630.00 Bid Total | $85,687.50 | Bid Total | $ 86,805.00 | Bid Total No Bid
PLANT MIX PAVEMENTS
448, Asphalt Concrete, Intermediate
Course, Type 2 200 TON $ 46.00| $ 9,200.00] $ 45.00 | $ 9,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 4850 |$ 9,700.00
448, Asphalt Concrete, Surface Course,
Type 1 1,200 TON $ 53.75| $ 64,500.00| $ 54.00| $ 64,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 57.00 | $ 68,400.00
Bid Total | $ 73,700.00 Bid Total [ $ 73,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid Bid Total [ $ 78,100.00
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