BID TABULATION

LAKE COUNTY ENGINEER'S ROAD DEPARTMENT

SALT AND CINDERS - 2016
Project No. 16-007-02

Compass Minerals America Inc.
9900 West 109th St., Ste. 100
Overland Park, KS 66210
PH: 1-800-323-1641

FX: 913.338.7945

Morton Salt, Inc.
123 N. Wacker Drive
Chicago, IL 60606-1743
PH: 888-800-8905

FX: 440-639-4205

Cargill, Inc.
24950 Country Club Blvd., Ste.
North Olmstead, Ohio 44070
PH: 440.716.4677

FX: 888.739.8705

Estimated | Measure

Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item Total
TREATED ROCK SALT
Delivered w/ piler - Lost Nation Yard 4,500 TON No Bid $ 68.47] $ 308,115.00| % 73.31]% 329,895.00
Delivered w/ piler - Painesville Yard 5,000 TON No Bid $ 68.47] $ 342,350.00| % 73.31]% 366,550.00
Delivered w/piler - Madison Yard 2,500 TON No Bid $ 68.47| $ 171,175.00| $ 73.31]% 183,275.00
TOTAL -TREATED ROCK SALT No Bid $ 821,640.00 $ 879,720.00
UNTREATED BULK ROCK SALT
Delivered w/piler - Painesville Yard 6,000 TON $ 47.67 286,020.00| $ 55.04] $ 330,240.00 No Bid
Delivered w/piler - Madison Yard 3,000 TON $ 46.05 138,150.00| $ 55.04] $ 165,120.00 No Bid
Delivered w/piler - Lost Nation Yard 6,000 TON $ 48.80 292,800.00| $ 55.04] $ 330,240.00 No Bid
TOTAL - UNTREATED BULK
ROCK SALT 716,970.00 $ 825,600.00 No Bid
CINDERS
Cinders - (A) 4,000 TON No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cinders - (B) 3,000 TON No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL - CINDERS No Bid No Bid No Bid
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