BID TABULATION

Roadway Materials 2015
Lake County Engineer's Road Department

Project No. 15-006-02

Osborne Concrete & Stone

One Williams Street
P.O. Box 249

Grand River, OH 44045
PH: 440-357-5562
FX: 440-357-8560

The Arms Trucking Co.
P.O. Box 369

14818 Mayfield Road
E. Claridon, OH 44033
PH: 800-362-1343
FX: 440-635-0988

Kokosing Material, Inc.
P.O. Box 334
Fredericktown, OH 43019
PH: 740-694-9585

FX: 740-694-1100

Estimated Measure
Ref. No. Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item Total
A. LIMESTONE
1 #12 Delivered/Painesville 250 TON 20.15 5,037.50 20.95| $ 5,237.50 No Bid
2 #57/#67 Delivered/Painesville 2,000 TON 20.25 40,500.00 2095| $ 41,900.00 No Bid
3 #304/#411/#617 Delivered/ Madison 500 TON 16.90 8,450.00 18.65[ $ 9,325.00 No Bid
4 #304/#411/#617 Delivered/ Painesville 750 TON 15.75 11,812.50 16.55( $ 12,412.50 No Bid
5 #8 Delivered/Painesville 500 TON 21.45 10,725.00 2225 $ 11,125.00 No Bid
6 Type D Limestone - Delivered/Painesville 250 TON 38.25 9,562.50 29.85| $ 7,462.50 No Bid
Bid Total 86,087.50 Bid Total| $ 87,462.50 Bid Total No Bid
B. PLANT MIX PAVEMENTS
#448, Asphalt Concrete, Intermediate
1 Course, Type 2 300 TON 48.50 14,550.00 No Bid $ 49.00] $ 14,700.00
#448, Asphalt Concrete, Surface Course,
2 Type 1 750 TON 57.00 42,750.00 No Bid $ 59.00| $ 44,250.00
Bid Total 57,300.00 Bid Total No Bid Bid Total] $ 58,950.00

Bid Opening April 29, 2015




